
Push for Competition to Lower Drug Prices Advocacy Tool Kit

The “Push For Competition To Lower Drug Prices” is in full swing! As part of this push, over 30
organizations representing patients, consumers, seniors, churches, students, unions, and
disease advocacy groups are calling on the Senate to immediately advance and pass
bipartisan bills that crack down on the drug industry’s anti-competitive practices and close
regulatory loopholes to promote generic and biosimilar competition to lower drug prices.

Here are three actions to help spread the word!

1. Post on social media about the push!

Sample copy:

🚨Join us in calling on the Senate to immediately pass bipartisan bills that crack down on Big
Pharma's anti-competitive practices & close regulatory loopholes to promote competition and
lower drug prices! Check out https://patientspushforcompetition.org to learn how to get
involved!

Big Pharma has been abusing the system to maintain monopoly prices and prevent
competition. Patients deserve affordable options. Go to https://patientspushforcompetition.org
and tell your senators that it’s time to pass bipartisan reforms to lower drug prices now!

Patent thickets, pay for delay and product hopping are all tactics that Big Pharma uses to game
the system and keep our drug prices high. It’s time to crack down on drug company gaming and
promote competition. Learn more at https://patientspushforcompetition.org

https://patientspushforcompetition.org
https://patientspushforcompetition.org


2. Use the “Letter to Your Senator” tool HERE!

On https://patientspushforcompetition.org, our advocacy hub, P4ADNow has a letter to your
senator tool! This tool offers a template letter to send to your legislators regarding bipartisan
bills to increase competition and lower drug prices.

Writing a letter to your senator is a crucial step in passing reforms that crack down on Big
Pharma's anti-competitive practices & close regulatory loopholes! Please circulate this letter
tool widely within your networks.

3. Share these graphics on social media to elevate patient voices! Each of these
patient stories pairs with a pharma abuse or a specific drug below, feel free to share
them together!

Sample Copy:

Big Pharma's abuses impact real people. Read stories from patients and join our community’s
push for competition→ https://patientspushforcompetition.org

Drug companies are gaming the system, but Congress can act now to lower drug prices for
patients by passing bipartisan legislation to promote competition. Go to:
https://patientspushforcompetition.org to learn more.

Drug Price Reform

https://action.patientsforaffordabledrugsnow.org/a/patent-reform-campaign-letter-to-senator
https://patientspushforcompetition.org
https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/11NBl0zvnwwUhDXEREvibXr_q1z-9e3ZE?usp=sharing
https://patientspushforcompetition.org
https://patientspushforcompetition.org


Product hopping



Pay for Delay



Patent Thickets


